CONNECT] BCcc&L

- - - - —~—y AIDING BUSINESS
EXCELLENCE IN LEGAL DELIVERABLES SINCE 1833

5315t Issue: 16" November 2025 - 22" November 2025

TAX CONNECT

Knowledge Partner:
BCC&L

AIDING BUSINESS
SINCE 1833

7/'-,-
L g
Azadi g,

Ministry Of Finance Inlndia .1y Mahotsav

8 wodbery o (2261614111 =

TAX CONNECT:

Mumbai : Unit No. 312, Omega Business Park, Near-Kaamgar Hospital, Road No. 33, Wagle Industrial Estate
Thane (West), Maharashtra — 400604

Bengaluru : 951, 24t Main Road, J P Nagar, Bengaluru, Karnataka — 560078.

Delhi (NCR) :B-139, 2"Floor, Transport Nagar, Noida-201301 (U.P)

Kolkata : 6, Netaji Subhas Road, 3rd Floor, Royal Exchange Building, Kolkata — 700001
- Room No. 119, 15tFloor, “Diamond Arcade” 1/72, Cal Jessore Road, Kolkata — 700055
- Tobacco House, 1, Old Court House St, Radha Bazar, Corner, Kolkata, West Bengal 700001

Dubai : Azizi Feirouz, 803, 8" Floor, AL Furjan, Opposite Discovery Pavillion, Dubai, UAE

Contact :+91 7003384915

Website : www.taxconnect.co.in

Email :+ info@taxconnect.co.in

Tax Connect: 531st Issue
16th November 2025- 22nd November 2025



http://www.taxconnect.co.in/
mailto:info@taxconnect.co.in

CONNEC

EXCELLENCE IN LEGAL DELIVERABLES

Bcc&L

AIDING BUSINESS
SINCE 1833

EDITORIAL

[ ]

Friends,
The GSTR 3B for the tax period October 2025 is the final

compliance Gateway for FY 2024-25. The October 2025 GST
return is one of the most consequential filings of the year. It
serves as the last statutory window for taxpayers to finalise
multiple adjustments and reconciliations relating to Financial
Year 2024-25. With the due date, 30th November 2025, fast
approaching, businesses must conduct a meticulous review of
their outward supplies, Input Tax Credit (ITC) claims, vendor
compliances, and annual reversals. Errors or omissions left
uncorrected at this stage may lead to permanent ITC loss,
mismatches in GSTR-9, and possible scrutiny and audit-related

exposures.

We hereunder outlined 10 critical compliance actions every
registered taxpayer should complete before filing the October
2025 GST Returns, ensuring clean and dispute-free reporting for

FY 2024-25.

1. Reconciliation of Outward Supplies (GSTR-1 vs GSTR-3B vs
Books): Taxpayers must ensure that outward supplies reported
in GSTR-1 and GSTR-3B are fully aligned with the books of
accounts. Any missing invoices, over-reported values, or
incorrect tax classifications pertaining to FY 2024-25 must be
corrected in the October 2025 return. This is the final
opportunity to adjust outward supply figures before they get

locked into the annual return (GSTR-9) and departmental cross-

verification.

2. Annual ITC Reversal under GST: Businesses engaged in
supplies like taxable vs exempt, or incurred expenditure in the
nature of business vs non-business. must perform their annual
recalculation of ITC reversals for FY 2024-25. Any short reversal
identified must be reversed in the October 2025 GSTR-3B, and

any excess reversal may be reclaimed.

3. Final Deadline for Issuance of Credit Notes: Credit notes in
relation to supplies made for FY 2024-25 must be issued in
terms of Section 34 of the CGST Act 2017, hence the Credit
Notes must be issued and reported in GSTR-1 and GSTR-3B by
the October 2025 return. Beyond this period, taxpayers lose the
ability to reduce outward tax liability through credit notes for FY

2024-25 transactions.

4. Mandatory Reconciliation of ITC as per Books of Accounts
with GSTR-2B: Under Rule 36(4), ITC can be claimed only to the
extent available in GSTR-2B. Hence, taxpayers must perform a
line-by-line  reconciliation  between  their  purchase
registers/books and GSTR-2B for FY 2024-25. Section 16(4)
makes this exercise critical. Any pending ITC for FY 2024-25
must be claimed by 30th November 2025. Failure to act now will

permanently forfeit such ITC.

7. Impact of Changes in GSTR-9 (FY 2024-25): GSTR-9 for FY
2024-25 has been revised. Table 8A will now include ITC of FY
2024-25 appearing in GSTR-2B of FY 2025-26 (April to October
2025). Taxpayers must verify whether such ITC has been claimed
in any of the GSTR-3B returns from April to October 2025. If not,
it should be claimed in the October 2025 GSTR-3B, subject to
Section 16(4). This ensures complete reconciliation between

GSTR-2B, GSTR-3B and GSTR-9.

8. Impact of ITC in GSTR-9C (FY 2024-25): Table 12C of Form

GSTR 9C contains the details of “ITC booked in current Financial

Tax Connect: 531st Issue
16th November 2025- 22nd November 2025

Page2




CONNEC

EXCELLENCE IN LEGAL DELIVERABLES

Bcc&L

AIDING BUSINESS
SINCE 1833

EDITORIAL

Year to be claimed in subsequent Financial Years”. Hence, a
detailed reconciliation shall be done at the time of filing of GSTR
3B for October 2025 for ITC availed pertaining to the
transactions for the FY 2024-25 so that the reconciliation
required in Table 12 of GSTR 9C can be done and be reported

accordingly.

9. Rule 37A - ITC Reversal where supplier has not filed GSTR-
3B: Rule 37A mandates reversal of ITC where:
e The supplier has reported invoices in GSTR-1,
e But has not filed GSTR-3B or paid tax for that period
e Up to 30th September of the following FY.
For FY 2024-25, such ITC must be reversed in GSTR-3B by 30th
November 2025.
It is to be noted that :
1. ITC already reversed earlier under Rule 37A should not
be reversed again.
2. Unavailed ITC (e.g., invoices rejected or kept pending in
IMS) does not require reversal.
3. Maintain proper documentation for all non-reversal

positions for audit readiness.

10. The Importance of Self-Assessment Under Section 59: GST
remains a self-assessment regime. Taxpayers must ensure that:
e All reconciliations are completed,
e All reversals are justified,
e All ITC claims are supported by valid documents and
appear in GSTR-2B, and
e All outward supplies are accurately declared.
The October return therefore serves as the final checkpoint
before the department begins comparing annual returns with

monthly data.

The October 2025 GST return is far more than a routine monthly

filing; it is the compliance closure point for FY 2024-25.

Completing reconciliations, ITC validations, credit note
reporting, vendor follow-ups, and annual reversals within this
window is crucial to avoid denial of credit, audit challenges, and

financial exposure.

Taxpayers who act proactively will not only safeguard eligible
ITC but also ensure that their GSTR-9 reporting for FY 2024-25

is clean, accurate, and robust.

Just to reiterate, we remain available over telecom or e-mail

for any clarifications.

Editor:
Vivek Jalan

Partner - Tax Connect Advisory Services LLP

Co-Editor:
Rohit Sharma

Joint Partner — Tax Connect Advisory Services LLP

Tax Connect: 531st Issue
16th November 2025- 22nd November 2025

Page3



TA><CONNECT]

EXCELLENCE IN LEGAL DELIVERABLES

BCCc&L

AIDING BUSINESS
SINCE 1833

16th November 2025- 22nd November 2025

SYNOPSIS
S.NO. | TOPICS PAGE NO.
1] TAX CALENDER 5
2] INCOME TAX 6-7
APPROVAL OF M/S HARI SHANKAR SINGHANIA ELASTOMER & TYRE RESEARCH
NOTIFICATION | \NSTITUTE FOR SCIENTIFIC RESEARCH UNDER SECTION 35(1)(IIA) OF THE INCOME
AGREEMENT AND PROTOCOL BETWEEN THE REPUBLIC OF INDIA AND THE
NOTIFICATION | GOVERNMENT OF THE KINGDOM OF BELGIUM FOR THE AVOIDANCE OF DOUBLE
TAXATION AND THE PREVENTION OF FISCAL EVASION WITH RESPECT TO TAXES ON
NOTIFICATION | TAX EXEMPTION ON SPECIFIED INCOME OF "AYODHYA VIKAS PRADHIKARAN
(AYODHYA DEVELOPMENT AUTHORITY)" U/S 10(46A) OF INCOME-TAX ACT, 1961 -
TAX EXEMPTION ON SPECIFIED INCOME OF "HARYANA BUILDING AND OTHER
NOTIFICATION CONSTRUCTION WORKERS WELFARE BOARD" U/S 10(46) OF INCOME-TAX ACT,
101
3] GST 8
CASE LAW BRATIN SIKDER VERSUS STATE OF WEST BENGAL & ORS: CALCUTTA HIGH COURT
4] FEMA 9
AMENDMENTS IN FOREIGN EXCHANGE MANAGEMENT (EXPORT OF GOODS AND
NOTIFICATION | gpRyiCES) (SECOND AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS, 2025
5] CUSTOMS 10-15
SEEKS TO AMEND NOTIFICATION NOS. 27/2011-CUSTOMS, DATED THE 1ST MARCH,
NOTIFICATION | 2011 AND 45/2025-CUSTOMS, DATED THE 24TH OCTOBER, 2025 - 48/2025 -
CUSTOMS -TARIFF
NOTIFICATION | FIXATION OF TARIFF VALUE OF EDIBLE OILS, BRASS SCRAP, ARECA NUT, GOLD AND
SILVER - 74/2025 - CUSTOMS - NON TARIFF
NOTIFICATION IMPOSITION OF ANTI-DUMPING DUTY ON IMPORTS OF HOT ROLLED FLAT
PRODUCTS OF ALLOY OR NON-ALLOY STEEL ORIGINATING IN OR EXPORTED FROM
LEVY OF ANTI-DUMPING DUTY ON IMPORTS OF FLAX FABRICS (HAVING FLAX
NOTIFICATION CONTENT OF MORE THAN 50%) IMPORTED FROM CHINA AND HONG KONG FOR A
PERIOD OF 5 YEARS
INSTRUCTION SYNCING OF ITC (HS), 2022 - SCHEDULE-1 (IMPORT POLICY) WITH FINANCE ACT
2025 (NO. 07 OF 2025) DATED 29.03.2025
6] DGFT 16
CLARIFICATION ON REDEMPTION OF ADVANCE AUTHORISATIONS IMPACTED BY
NOTIFICATION ERSTWHILE RULE 96(10) OF THE CGST RULES AND IMPORTS EFFECTED BETWEEN
OCTOBER 13, 2017 TO JANUARY 09, 2019
7] INCOME TAX BILL 2025 WITH COMMENTARY 17
8] UNION BUDGET — 2025 EDITION 18
9] INCOME TAX SECTION-WISE COMMENTARY AND ANALYSIS OF RECENT 19
10] UNION BUDGET - 2024 EDITION 20
11] GST APPELLATE TRIBUNAL (GSTAT) 21
12] GST PLEADING AND PRACTICE: WITH SECTION-WISE GST CASES & GST NOTICES 22
13] HANDBOOK ON GST 2022 23
14] TAX PLEADING AND PRACTICE JOURNAL 24
15] HOW TO HANDLE GST LITIGATION: ASSESSMENT, SCRUTINY, AUDIT & APPEAL 25
16] LET’S DISCUSS FURTHER 26
Tax Connect: 531st [ssue Page4



CONNECT] BCcCc&

AIDING BUSINESS
EXCELLENCE IN LEGAL DELIVERABLES SINCE 1833

TAX CALENDAR

Form/Return/Challan Reporting Period Description
Summary return of outward supplies and input
tax credit claimed, along with payment of tax by

a registered person with aggregate turnover

GSTR-3B
2 2 exceeding INR 5 Crores during the preceding

financial year or any registered person who has

opted to file monthly return.

Tax Connect: 531st Issue
16th November 2025- 22nd November 2025




CONNECT]

EXCELLENCE IN LEGAL DELIVERABLES

INCOME

NOTIFICATION

APPROVAL OF M/S HARI SHANKAR SINGHANIA ELASTOMER &

TYRE RESEARCH INSTITUTE FOR SCIENTIFIC RESEARCH UNDER
SECTION 35(1)(I1A) OF THE INCOME TAX ACT, 1961

OUR COMMENTS: The Pr. Chief Commissioner of Income Tax
(Exemptions), Central Board of Direct Taxes vide Notification No.
04/2025 dated 12.11.2025 notified that in exercise of the powers
conferred by section 35(1)(iia) of the Income Tax Act, 1961, read
with Rule 5F of the Income Tax Rules 1962, the Pr. Chief
Commissioner of Income Tax (Exemptions), Delhi hereby accords
approval to the comp any M/s Hari Shankar Sighania Elastomer
& Tyre Research Institute, 437, Hebbal Industrial Area, Mysore,
Hebbal -570016 (PAN:
AAACH8878G), for 'Scientific Research' for the purpose of
the clause (iia) of sub-section (1) of section 35 of the Income-tax
Act, 1961 read with rule 5F of Income-tax Rules, 1962.

Layout S.0., Mysuru, Karnataka,

2. This Notification shall be applicable for five Assessment years

(AY) from A.Y. 2022-23 to A.Y. 2026-27.

[For further details please refer the Notification]

NOTIFICATION

AGREEMENT AND PROTOCOL BETWEEN THE REPUBLIC OF
INDIA AND THE GOVERNMENT OF THE KINGDOM OF BELGIUM
FOR THE AVOIDANCE OF DOUBLE TAXATION AND THE
PREVENTION OF FISCAL EVASION WITH RESPECT TO TAXES ON
INCOME

OUR COMMENTS: The Central Board of Direct Taxes vide
Notification No. 160/2025 dated 10.11.2025 notified that
Whereas, the Protocol, amending the Agreement and the
Protocol between the Government of the Republic of India and
the Government of the Kingdom of Belgium for the avoidance of
double taxation and the prevention of fiscal evasion with respect
to taxes on income, signed at Brussels on the 26th April, 1993,

was signed at New Delhi on the 9th March, 2017, as set out in

BCcc&L

AIDING BUSINESS
SINCE 1833

TAX

the Annexure appended to this notification (hereinafter referred

to as the said Amending Protocol);

And whereas the date of entry into force of the said Amending
Protocol is the 26th June, 2025, being the date of the later of the
notifications of the completion of the legal requirements and
procedures for giving effect to the said Amending Protocol in
accordance with paragraph 2 of Article 4 of the said Amending

Protocol;

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-
section (1) of section 90 of the Income-tax Act, 1961 (43 of
1961), the Central Government hereby directs that all the

provisions of the said Amending Protocol, as set out in the

Annexure hereto, shall be given effect to in the Union of India.

[For further details please refer the Notification]

NOTIFICATION

TAX EXEMPTION ON SPECIFIED INCOME OF "AYODHYA VIKAS

PRADHIKARAN (AYODHYA DEVELOPMENT AUTHORITY)" U/S
10(46A) OF INCOME-TAX ACT, 1961 -

OUR COMMENTS: The Central Board of Direct Taxes vide
Notification No. 159/2025 dated 07.11.2025 notified that in
exercise of the powers conferred by sub-clause (b) of clause
(46A) of section 10 of the Income-tax Act, 1961 (43 of 1961),
(hereinafter referred to as “the Income-tax Act”), the Central
Government hereby notifies “Ayodhya Vikas Pradhikaran
(Ayodhya Development Authority)” [AAALA0206C] (hereinafter
referred to as “the assessee”), an authority constituted under

the Uttar Pradesh Urban Planning and Development Act, 1973

(President Act 11 of 1973), for the purposes of the said clause.

2. This notification shall be effective from the assessment year

2024-25, subject to the condition that the assessee continues to

Tax Connect: 531st [ssue
16th November 2025- 22nd November 2025

Page6



https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?id=3557
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=222
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?id=10399
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=223
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?id=3557
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=222
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=222
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?id=10399
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=223
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?id=3179
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?id=3179
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=222
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=222
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?id=8618
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?id=8618
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=222

CONNECT]

EXCELLENCE IN LEGAL DELIVERABLES

INCOME

BCcc&L

AIDING BUSINESS
SINCE 1833

TAX

be an authority constituted under the Uttar Pradesh Urban

Planning and Development Act, 1973 (President’s Act 11 of 1973)

with one or more of the purposes specified in sub-clause (a) of

clause (46A) of section 10 of the Income-tax Act.

[For further details please refer the Notification.]

NOTIFICATION

TAX EXEMPTION ON SPECIFIED INCOME OF "HARYANA
BUILDING AND OTHER CONSTRUCTION WORKERS WELFARE
BOARD" U/S 10(46) OF INCOME-TAX ACT, 1961 -

OUR COMMENTS: The Central Board of Direct Taxes vide
Notification No. 158/2025 dated 07.11.2025 notified that in

exercise of the powers conferred by clause (46) of section 10 of

the Income-tax Act, 1961 (43 of 1961), the Central Government
hereby notifies for the purposes of the said clause, ‘Haryana
Building and Other Construction Workers Welfare Board’,
Panchkula, (PAN: AAATH6995H) a Board constituted by the State
Government of Haryana, in respect of the following specified

income arising to that Board, namely:-

(a) Registration fees and yearly subscription collected from
construction workers registered with the Haryana Building and

Other Construction Workers Welfare Board as beneficiaries.

(b) Proceeds of the cess collected under the Building and Other
Construction Workers Welfare Cess Act, 1996 (28 of 1996) and

rules thereunder; and
(c) Interest Income received on bank deposits.

2. This notification shall be effective subject to the conditions
that ‘Haryana Building and Other Construction Workers Welfare

Board’, Panchkula -

(a) shall not engage in any commercial activity;

(b) activities and the nature of the specified income shall remain

unchanged throughout the financial years; and

(c) shall file return of income in accordance with the provision
of clause (g) of sub-section (4C) of section 139 of the Income-tax

Act, 1961.

3. This notification shall be applicable from financial years 2025-

26 to 2029-30 relevant to assessment years 2026-27 to 2030-31.

[For further details please refer the Notification.]

Tax Connect: 531st Issue
16th November 2025- 22nd November 2025

Page7



https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?id=8618
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?id=8618
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=222
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?id=8618
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=222
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?id=3285
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=222
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=222

CONNECT]

EXCELLENCE IN LEGAL DELIVERABLES

BCC&L

AIDING BUSINESS

SINCE 1833

GST

CASE LAW

BRATIN SIKDER VERSUS STATE OF WEST BENGAL & ORS:
CALCUTTA HIGH COURT

OUR COMMENTS: In the instant case “Principles of natural
justice - no opportunity of hearing was afforded to the
petitioner prior to passing of the impugned order - period of
limitation for challenging an adjudication order - which date
should be taken to be the starting point of limitation in a case

of this nature?”

It has been held that the Hon’ble Division Bench in the case of
Ram Kumar Sinhal vs. State of West Bengal, [2025 (7) TMI
1866 - CALCUTTA HIGH COURT] held that the accessibility of
the notice only under the Additional Tab, as opposed to the
Normal Tab, could not constitute a proper communication or
uploading as contemplated in Section 73(1) of the WBGST Act,

read with the concerned Rules.

By applying the proposition of law laid down by the Hon’ble
Division Bench in the case of Ram Kumar Sinhal, this Court
holds that the accessibility of the notice in the instant case
under the Additional Tab could not constitute a proper
communication or uploading as contemplated in Section
73(1) of the WBGST Act, 2017 read with the concerned Rules.
Therefore, the date of uploading of the order under the
Additional Tab cannot be the starting point of limitation for

assailing such an order.

This Court, therefore, holds that there was no delay and

latches on the part of the petitioner in approaching this Court.

After going through the show-cause notice dated March 22,
2022, this Court finds that it has been stated therein that the
petitioner may appear before the authority for personal

hearing either in person or through authorized representative

for representing his case on the date, time and venue - From
the SCN issued under Section 73(1), it is evident that an
adverse decision was contemplated against the petitioner
and the impugned order was passed determining the tax,
interest and penalty without affording any opportunity of

hearing to the petitioner.

It is now well settled that where any adverse decision is
contemplated against a person, an opportunity of hearing
shall be granted which is a statutory mandate and an order
passed by the proper officer in violation of such mandate,

cannot be sustained.

This Court has already observed that no date, time and venue
of the personal hearing was mentioned in the show-cause
notice and, therefore, no opportunity of hearing could be said
to have been afforded to the petitioner prior to passing the
impugned order. Thus, there has been violation of the
statutory mandate as well as gross violation of the principles
of natural justice - this Court is inclined to grant relief in favour

of the writ petitioner.

The order dated April 25, 2022 is set aside and quashed -

Petition allowed.

[For further Form details please refer the Case Law]

Tax Connect: 531st Issue
16th November 2025- 22nd November 2025

Page8



https://www.taxtmi.com/caselaws?id=775798
https://www.taxtmi.com/caselaws?id=775798

CONNECT]

EXCELLENCE IN LEGAL DELIVERABLES

Bcc&L

AIDING BUSINESS
SINCE 1833

FEMA

NOTIFICATION (i) in sub-regulation (1), in clause (i) for the words ‘one year’, the

AMENDMENTS IN FOREIGN EXCHANGE MANAGEMENT Words ‘three years’shall be substituted.

(EXPORT OF GOODS AND SERVICES) (SECOND AMENDMENT)
REGULATIONS, 2025

OUR COMMENTS:
Reserve Bank of India, issued notification vide F. No. FEMA
23(R)/(7)/2025-RB dated 13.11.2025. As the

notification, amendments in Foreign Exchange Management

The (Foreign Exchange Department),

per said

(Export of Goods and Services) (Second Amendment)

Regulations, 2025 are notified.

In exercise of the powers conferred by Section 7, Section 8 and
sub-section (2) of section 47 of the Foreign Exchange
Management Act, 1999 (42 of 1999), the Reserve Bank of India
makes the following amendments to the Foreign Exchange
Management (Export of Goods & Services) Regulations, 2015
[Notification No. FEMA 23(R)/2015-RB dated January 12, 2016]
(hereinafter referred to as 'the Principal Regulations'), namely:

1. Short Title and Commencement:-

(i) These regulations may be called the Foreign Exchange

Management (Export of Goods and Services) (Second

Amendment) Regulations, 2025

(ii) They shall come into force from the date of their publication
in the Official Gazette.

2. Amendment to Regulation 9:-
In the principal regulations, in regulation 9 -

(i) in sub-regulation (1) for the words ‘nine months’, the words
‘fiftteen months’ shall be substituted.

(ii) in sub-regulation (2), in clause (a) for the words ‘nine
months’, the words ‘fifteen months’ shall be substituted.

3. Amendment to Regulation 15:-

In the principal regulations, in regulation 15 -

(i) in proviso to sub-regulation (1), for the words ‘one year’, the

words ‘three years’ shall be substituted.

(iii) in sub-regulation (2), for the words ‘one year’, the words
‘three years’ shall be substituted.

[For further details please refer the notification.]

Tax Connect: 531st Issue
16th November 2025- 22nd November 2025

Page9



CONNECT]

EXCELLENCE IN LEGAL DELIVERABLES

CUSTOMS

BCC&L

AIDING BUSINESS

SINCE 1833

2.145/2025- | In the said notification, in the TABLE |,-
SEEKS TO AMEND NOTIFICATION NOS. 27/2011-CUSTOMS, Customs, | i.againstS. No. 43, in column (2), for the
DATED THE 1ST MARCH, 2011 AND 45/2025-CUSTOMS, dated entry, the entry “1508, 1509, 1510 (other
DATED THE 24TH OCTOBER, 2025 - 48/2025 - CUSTOMS - the 24th than 1510 10 00), 1512 (other than 1512
TARIFF October, 11 10), 1513, 1515” shall be substituted;
OUR COMMENTS: The Central Board of Indirect Taxes and 2025, ii. after SI. No. 45 and the entries relating
Customs, Ministry of Finance, Department of Revenue vide published i | thereto, the following SI. No. and the
Notification No. 48/2025-Customs dated 14.11.2025 In n the entries shall be inserted, namely: -
exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section Gazette of || (2) (3) (4) (5
25 of the Customs Act, 1962 (52 of 1962),the Central India, Extra || 1510 All goods 15% -
Government, on being satisfied that it is necessary in the public ordinary, 1000
interest so to do, hereby amends the following notifications of Part Il,
the Government of India in the Ministry of Finance Section 3,
(Department of Revenue), specified in column (2) of the Table Sub-
below, to the extent specified in the corresponding entries in section
column (3) of the said Table, namely:- (i), vide nu
mber
TABLE G.S.R.
S. | Notificatio | Amendments 781(E), dat
n No. ed the
o. | and Date 24th
(11(2) (3) October,
) 2025
1.|27/2011- In the said notification, in the TABLE,-
Customes, after SI. No. 65 and the entries relating [For further details please refer the Notification]
dated thereto, the following Sl. No. and the
the 1st entries shall be inserted, namely: -
March, 2) (3) FIXATION OF TARIFF VALUE OF EDIBLE OILS, BRASS SCRAP,
2011, 703 10 00 Cane Molasses ARECA NUT, GOLD AND SILVER - 74/2025 - CUSTOMS - NON
published TARIFF
in the OUR COMMENTS: The Central Board of Indirect Taxes and
Gazette of Customs, Ministry of Finance, Department of Revenue vide
India, Extra Notification No. 74/2025-Customs (N.T.) dated 14.11.2025 In
ordinary, exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (2) of section
Part Il, 14 of the Customs Act, 1962 (52 of 1962), the Central Board of
Section 3, Indirect Taxes & Customs, being satisfied that it is necessary
Sub- and expedient to do so, hereby makes the following
section (i), amendments in the notification of the Government of India in
vide numb the Ministry of Finance (Department of Revenue), No.
er G.S.R. 36/2001-Customs (N.T.), dated the 3rd August, 2001,
153(E), dat published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part-Il,
ed the 1st Section-3, Sub-section (ii), vide number S. O. 748 (E), dated the
March, 3rd August, 2001, namely:-
2011

Tax Connect: 531st Issue
16th November 2025- 22nd November 2025

Page10


https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?id=983
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?id=983
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=34
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=23416
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=23416
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=23416
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=23416
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=23416
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=23416
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=23416
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=23416
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=23416
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=23416
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=23416
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=23416
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=23416
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=23416
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=23416
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=23416
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=23416
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=23416
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=23416
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=23416
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=23416
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?id=971
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?id=971
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=34
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=1823
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=1823
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=1823
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=1823
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=1823
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=1823

CONNECT]

EXCELLENCE IN LEGAL DELIVERABLES

CUSTOMS

BCcCc&L

AIDING BUSINESS
SINCE 1833

“TABLE-1

In the said notification, for TABLE-1, TABLE-2, and TABLE-3 the
following Tables shall be substituted, namely: -

Chapter/

heading/

subheading/tariff

item

Description
of goods

Tariff
value (US SPer
Metric Tonne)

(2)

(3) (4)

15111000

Crude Palm | 1066
Oil

15119010

RBD Palm Oil | 1084

15119090

Others — 11075
Palm Qil

15111000

Crude 1088
Palmolein

151190 20

RBD 1091
Palmolein

15119090

Others 1090
Palmolein

1507 1000

Crude Soya| 1159
bean Qil

7404 00 22

Brass Scrap | 6163
(all grades)

TABLE-2

Chapter/
heading/

subheading/tariff

item

Description of goods

Tariff
value

(US$)

(i) Silver, in any form,
other than medallions
and silver coins having
silver content not below
99.9% or semi-
manufactured forms of
silver falling under sub-
heading 7106 92;

(ii) Medallions and silver
coins having

silver content not below
99.9% or semi-
manufactured forms of
silver falling under sub-
heading 7106 92, other
than imports of such
goods through post,
courier or baggage.

Explanation. - For the
purposes of this entry,
silver in any form shall
not include foreign
currency coins, jewellery
made of silver or articles
made of silver.

1739 per
kilogram

(2)

(3)

(4)

71 or 98

Gold, in any form, in
respect of which the
benefit of entries

at serial number 194 of
the Notification No.
45/2025-Customs dated
24.10.2025 is availed

1350 per
10
grams

Silver, in any form, in
respect of which the
benefit of entries

at serial number 195 of
the Notification No.
45/2025-Customs dated
24.10.2025 is availed

1739 per
kilogram

(i) Gold bars,

other than tola bars,
bearing manufacturer’s
or refiner’s engraved
serial number and
weight expressed in
metric units;

(i) Gold coins having
gold content not below
99.5% and gold findings,
other than imports of
such goods through
post, courier or baggage.

Explanation. - For the
purposes of this entry,
“gold findings” means a
small component such as

1350 per
10
grams

Tax Connect: 531st Issue
16th November 2025- 22nd November 2025



https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144279

CONNECT]

EXCELLENCE IN LEGAL DELIVERABLES

BCC&L

AIDING BUSINESS
SINCE 1833

CUSTOMS

hook, clasp, clamp, pin,
catch, screw back used
to hold the whole or a
part of a piece of

Jewellery in place.

TABLE-3
Sl. | Chapter/ heading/ | Description | Tariff  value
No. | subheading/tariff item | of goods (US $ Per
Metric Ton)
(1) |(2) (3) (4)
1 080280 Areca nuts 7142 (i.e., no
change)”

2. This notification shall come into force with effect from the
15th day of November, 2025.

[For further details please refer the Notification]

NOTIFICATION

IMPOSITION OF ANTI-DUMPING DUTY ON IMPORTS OF HOT
ROLLED FLAT PRODUCTS OF ALLOY OR NON-ALLOY STEEL
ORIGINATING IN OR EXPORTED FROM VIETNAM

OUR COMMENTS: The Central Board of Indirect Taxes and
Customs, Ministry of Finance, Department of Revenue vide
Notification No. 32/2025-Customs(ADD) dated 12.11.2025
whereas in the matter of ‘Hot rolled flat products of alloy or
non-alloy steel’ (hereinafter referred to as the subject goods)
falling under tariff heading 7208, 7211, 7225 or 7226 of
the First Schedule to the Customs Tariff Act, 1975 (51 of
1975) (hereinafter referred to as the Customs Tariff Act),
originating in, or exported from Vietnam (hereinafter referred
to as the subject country), and imported into India, the
designated authority in its final findings, vide notification No.
06/15/2024-DGTR, dated the 13th August, 2025, published in
the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part |, Section 1, dated the
13th August, 2025, has inter-alia come to the conclusion that—

(i) the subject goods have been exported to India from the
subject country at a price below the normal value, resulting in
dumping;

(ii) the domestic industry has suffered injury as a result of
dumped imports;

(iii) there is also threat of further aggravated injury to the
domestic industry, if anti-dumping duty is not imposed on
import of subject goods from subject country,

and has recommended imposition of an anti-dumping duty on
the imports of subject goods, originating in, or exported from
the subject country and imported into India, in order to remove
injury to the domestic industry.

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-
sections (1) and (5) of section 9A of the Customs Tariff Act read
with rules 18 and 20 of the Customs Tariff (Identification,
Assessment and Collection of Anti-dumping Duty on Dumped
Articles and for Determination of Injury) Rules, 1995, the
Central Government, after considering the aforesaid final
findings of the designated authority, hereby imposes on the
subject goods, the description of which is specified in column
(3) of the Table below, falling under tariff heading of the First
in the
corresponding entry in column (2), originating in the country as

Schedule to the Customs Tariff Actas specified

specified in the corresponding entry in column (4), exported
from the countries as specified in the corresponding entry in
column (5), produced by the producers as specified in the
corresponding entry in column (6), and imported into India, an
antidumping duty at the rate equal to the amount as specified
in the corresponding entry in column (7), in the currency as
specified in the corresponding entry in column (9) and as per
unit of measurement as specified in the corresponding entry in
column (8), of the said Table, namely:-

Tax Connect: 531st Issue
16th November 2025- 22nd November 2025

Table

S | Tariff Desc | Country |Count |Pro |A |Unit |Cu
Headin |ripti |oforigin |ry of duc|m |of rre

N g on of export [er |ou nc

o] the nt |Mea |y

good sure
s men
t

((2) 3) |(4) (5) (6) [ (7) [(8) |(9)

1

)

1/7208,7 |Hot |Vietham |Any Ho | NI |MT |US
211,72 |rolle Count |a L D
25 and | d flat Pha
7226 prod tD

Page12



https://www.taxtmi.com/tariff?id=272
https://www.taxtmi.com/tariff?id=272
https://www.taxtmi.com/tariff?id=272
https://www.taxtmi.com/tariff?id=272
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?id=19784
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=35
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=35
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?id=1221
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?id=1221
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=35
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?id=1554
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?id=1563
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=66
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=66
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=66
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?id=19784
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?id=19784
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=35

CONNECT]

EXCELLENCE IN LEGAL DELIVERABLES

BCC&L

AIDING BUSINESS
SINCE 1833

CUSTOMS

ucts ry incl | ung
of uding | Qu
alloy at
or Vietna | Ste
non- m el
alloy JSC
steel
, hot
clad,
not
plate
d
or co
ated,
of a
thick
ness
upto
25
mm
and
widt
h upt
o
2100
mm
2 | -do- -do- | Vietham |Any Any |12 |MT |US
Count 1.5 D
ry 5
includi
ng
Vietna
m
3 |-do- -do- | Any Vietna | Any |12 | MT | US
countryo |'m 1.5 D
ther than 5
Vietnam

Note 1 : The Customs classification is indicative only and not
binding on the scope of the subject goods.

Note 2 : Subject goods do not cover hot-rolled flat products of
stainless steel.

2. The anti-dumping duty imposed under this notification shall
be effective for a period of five years (unless revoked,
superseded or amended earlier) from the date of publication
of this notification in the Official Gazette, and shall be payable
in Indian currency.

Explanation. — For the purposes of this notification, the rate of
exchange applicable for the purposes of calculation of such
anti-dumping duty shall be the rate which is specified in the
notification of the Government of India, in the Ministry of
Finance (Department of Revenue), issued from time to time, in
exercise of the powers conferred by section 14 of the Customs
Act, 1962 (52 of 1962), and the relevant date for the
determination of the rate of exchange shall be the date of
presentation of the bill of entry under section 46 of the said
Act.

[For further details please refer the Notification]

NOTIFICATION

LEVY OF ANTI-DUMPING DUTY ON IMPORTS OF FLAX FABRICS
(HAVING FLAX CONTENT OF MORE THAN 50%) IMPORTED
FROM CHINA AND HONG KONG FOR A PERIOD OF 5 YEARS

OUR COMMENTS: The Central Board of Indirect Taxes and
Customs, Ministry of Finance, Department of Revenue vide
Circular No. 31/2025-Customs(ADD) dated 07.11.2025 Notified
that whereas, the designated authority, vide notification No.
7/05/2025-DGTR dated the 29th March, 2025, published in the
Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part |, Section 1, had initiated
a review in the matter of continuation of anti-dumping duty on
imports of “Woven Fabric (having more than 50% Flax
content)” commonly known as “Flax Fabric” (hereinafter
referred to as the subject goods) falling under tariff heading
5309 of the First Schedule to the Customs Tariff Act, 1975 (51
of 1975) (hereinafter referred to as the Customs Tariff Act),
originating in or exported from China PR and Hong Kong
(hereinafter referred to as the subject countries), imposed vide
notification of the Government of India, in the Ministry of
Finance (Department of Revenue) No. 35/2020 -Customs
(ADD), dated the 10th November, 2020, published in the
Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part Il, Section 3, Sub-section
(i) vide number G.S.R. 697(E), dated the 10th November, 2020;

And whereas, in the matter of review of anti-dumping duty on
import of the subject goods, originating in or exported from the

Tax Connect: 531st Issue
16th November 2025- 22nd November 2025

Page13


https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?id=971
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=34
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=34
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?id=1023

CONNECT]

EXCELLENCE IN LEGAL DELIVERABLES

BCC&L

AIDING BUSINESS
SINCE 1833

CUSTOMS

subject countries, the designated authority in its final findings,
published vide notification No. 7/05/2025-DGTR dated the 8th
August 2025, in the Gazette of India Extraordinary, Part I,
Section 1, has come to the conclusion that-

(i) The volume of imports from subject countries have
increased in both absolute and relative terms, despite existing
duties;

(ii) Despite increase cost of raw materials leading to increase in
cost, the selling price could not increase proportionately as the
landed value of imports declined further. To compete with
imported subject goods and maintain market share domestic
industry has been constrained from

raising its price

proportionately, leading to price suppression;

(iii) imports are undercutting the prices of the domestic
industry in the market;

(iv) There is continued dumping of subject goods and material
injury to the domestic industry despite existing duties,

and has recommended imposition of anti-dumping duty on the
subject goods, originating in or exported from the subject
countries;

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-
sections (1) and (5) of section 9A of the Customs Tariff Act, read
with rules 18 and 23 of the Customs Tariff (Identification,
Assessment and Collection of Anti-dumping Duty on Dumped
Articles and for Determination of Injury) Rules, 1995, and in
supersession of the notification of the Government of India, in
the Ministry of Finance (Department of Revenue) No. 35/2020
-Customs (ADD), dated the 10th November, 2020, published in
the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part Il, Section 3, Sub-
section (i) vide number G.S.R. 697(E), dated the 10th
November, 2020, except as respects things done or omitted to
be done before such supersession the Central Government,
after considering the aforesaid final findings of the designated
authority, hereby
description of which is specified in column (3) of the Table
below, falling under tariff heading of the First Schedule to the
Customs Tariff Act as specified in the corresponding entry in

imposes on the subject goods, the

column (2), originating in the country as specified in the
corresponding entry in column (4), exported from the country
as specified in the corresponding entry in column (5), produced

by the producers as specified in the corresponding entry in
column (6) and exported by the exporters as specified in the
corresponding entry in column (7) and imported into India, an
anti-dumping duty at the rate equal to the amount as specified
in the corresponding entry in column (8), in the currency as
specified in the corresponding entry in column (10) and as per
unit of measurement as specified in the corresponding entry in
column (9) of the said Table, namely:-

TABLE

Tari | Desc
ff | ripti
He |on of |Origi |ofE (er |r nt
adi | Goo |n Xpo
ng |ds rt nt

2) ((3) (4 (5) (6) [(7) [(8) |(9)

Coun | Cou | Pro | Exp | Am | Unit Cur
orte |ou |of ren
Meas |cy
ureme

2 v

try of | ntry | duc

(10)

=~ -~

530 | Flax | China | Any |Any |Any | 2.3 | Per uss
meter
Linen

fabri

havin
g flax
cont
ent

of

more
than
50%
2 |530 |Flax |Any |Chi |Any |Any |[2.3 |Per uss
other | na 6 meter
Linen | than | PR
fabri | Hong
o Kong

havin
g flax
cont
ent

of

more
than
50%

Tax Connect: 531st Issue
16th November 2025- 22nd November 2025

Page14




CONNECT]

EXCELLENCE IN LEGAL DELIVERABLES

BCcCc&L

AIDING BUSINESS
SINCE 1833

CUSTOMS

3 /530
9 or

Flax |Hong |Any |Any | Any | 1.1 |Per uss

Kong 4 meter
Linen
fabri
C
havin
g flax
cont
ent
of
more
than
50%
Flax

4 |530
9 or

Any | Hon uss
other | g
Linen | than
fabri | China
c g
havin
g flax

cont

Any |Any | 1.1 |Per

meter

Kon

ent
of
more
than
50%

2. The anti-dumping duty imposed under this notification shall
be effective for a period of five years (unless revoked,
superseded or amended earlier) from the date of publication
of this notification in the Official Gazette and shall be paid in
Indian currency.

Explanation.- For the purposes of this notification, rate of
exchange applicable for the purposes of calculation of such
anti-dumping duty shall be the rate which is specified in the
notification of the Government of India, in the Ministry of
Finance (Department of Revenue), issued from time to time, in
exercise of the powers conferred by section 14 of the Customs
Act, 1962 (52 of 1962), and the relevant date for the
determination of the rate of exchange shall be the date of
presentation of the bill of entry under section 46 of the
said Customs Act.

[For further details please refer the Notification]

INSTRUCTION

SYNCING OF ITC (HS), 2022 - SCHEDULE-1 (IMPORT POLICY)
WITH FINANCE ACT 2025 (NO. 07 OF 2025) DATED 29.03.2025

OUR COMMENTS: The Central Board of Indirect Taxes and
Customs, Ministry of Finance, Department of Revenue vide
Instruction No. 32/2025-Customs dated 10.11.2025 Ordered in
reference to invited to DGFT Notification No. 44/2025-26
dated 15.10.2025 on the above subject (copy enclosed).

2. Vide the above Notification no. 44/2025-26 dated
15.10.2025, DGFT has amended the ITC (HS) 2022, Schedule-I
(Import Policy) in sync with the Finance Act 2025 (No. 7 of
2025) dated 29.03.2025. The list of ITC (HS) Codes and related
Policy Conditions inserted/deleted/amended/split/merged
under ITC (HS) 2022, Schedule-I (Import Policy) in sync with
the Finance Act, 2025 is annexed a s Annexure-l to the said
Notification. Further, the amendments in the Section Notes,
Chapter-wise Main Notes, supplementary Notes, Chapter
heading, subheadings and description of ITC (HS) codes in sync
with the Finance Act, 2025 are annexed as Annexure-ll to the
said Notification.

3. In view of the above, it is requested that necessary action
may be taken to sensitize officers under your jurisdiction
regarding the said matter.

4. The difficulties, if any, may be brought to the notice of the
Board.

[For further details please refer the Instruction]

Tax Connect: 531st Issue
16th November 2025- 22nd November 2025

Pagel5


https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?id=971
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=34
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=34
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?id=1023
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=34
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144258
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144258
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144258
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=144258
https://www.taxtmi.com/tariff?catId=33
https://www.taxtmi.com/tariff?catId=33
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=1415
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=1415
https://www.taxtmi.com/tariff?catId=33
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=1415
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=1415

CONNEC

EXCELLENCE IN LEGAL DELIVERABLES

BCC&L

AIDING BUSINESS

SINCE 1833

DGFT

CIRCULAR

CLARIFICATION ON REDEMPTION OF
AUTHORISATIONS IMPACTED BY ERSTWHILE RULE 96(10)
OF THE CGST RULES AND IMPORTS EFFECTED BETWEEN

OCTOBER 13, 2017 TO JANUARY 09, 2019

ADVANCE

OUR COMMENTS: The Ministry of Commerce and Industry
vide Notification No. 07/2025-26 dated 11.11.2025 clarified
that It has come to the notice of this Directorate that certain
exporters are facing difficulties in obtaining redemption of
Advance Authorisations (AAs) affected by the erstwhile
provisions of Rule 96 (10) of the CGST Rules, 2017. The said
Rule, prior to its amendment, restricted the refund of IGST
paid on exports in cases where the exporter or its supplier
had availed specified duty exemptions, such as those
under Customs Notification No. 79/2017-Customs, for
imports effected between October 13, 2017 and January 09,
2019.

2. It may kindly be recalled that pursuant to issuance
of Customs Notification No. 79/2017- Customs dated
October 13, 2017, this Directorate had issued Notification No.
33/2015-2020 dated October 13, 2017, modifying Para
4.14 of the Foreign Trade Policy (FTP) 2015-2020 to extend
exemption from payment of all duties, including IGST and
Compensation Cess, for physical exports under the Advance
Authorisation (AA) Scheme, subject to the pre-import
condition. Subsequently, following the issuance of
Customs Notification No. 01/2019-Customs dated January
10, 2019, the pre-import condition was formally withdrawn
through DGFT Notification No. 53/2015-2020 dated January
10, 2019, thereby allowing exemption from IGST and
Compensation Cess under the AA Scheme without prior
import requirements.

3. In compliance with the Hon'ble Supreme Court's judgment
dated April 28, 2023, the Customs Authorities issued Circular
No. 16/2023-Customs dated June 07, 2023. While upholding
the Revenue's appeal, the Hon'ble Court directed that
affected parties be permitted to claim refund or input tax
credit (ITC) wherever admissible. In alignment with the
above, this Directorate had also issued Trade Notice No.
07/2023-24 dated June 08, 2023 and Trade Notice No.
27/2023 dated September 25, 2023.

4. In continuation of the above, it is hereby clarified that the
Export Obligation Discharge Certificate (EODC) shall not be
withheld, provided all other requirements are duly fulfilled,
in the following cases:

i. Payment of IGST in Cash: Where IGST has been paid in cash
at the time of clearance of import consignments under the AA
Scheme during the period October 13, 2017 to January 09,
2019.

ii. Non-Availing of Duty Exemptions: Where the applicant
has not availed exemption from IGST, Compensation Cess, or
other levies (except Basic Customs Duty).

iii. Compliance with Pre-Import Condition: Where the
applicant has complied with the prescribed pre-import and

other procedural requirements under the Scheme.

This Policy Circular is issued with the approval of the DG,
DGFT

[For further details please refer the Circular.]

Tax Connect: 531st Issue
16th November 2025- 22nd November 2025

Pagel6



https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?id=28437
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=790
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=122269
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=122269
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=122269
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=122272
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=122272
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?id=30926
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?id=30926
https://www.taxtmi.com/acts?actId=811
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=127809
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=127809
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=127810
https://www.taxtmi.com/notifications?id=127810
https://www.taxtmi.com/circulars?id=66370
https://www.taxtmi.com/circulars?id=66370
https://www.taxtmi.com/circulars?id=66371
https://www.taxtmi.com/circulars?id=66371
https://www.taxtmi.com/circulars?id=66846
https://www.taxtmi.com/circulars?id=66846

CONNECT] BCC&L

AIDING BUSINESS
EXCELLENCE IN LEGAL DELIVERABLES SINCE 1833

IN STANDS NOW
INCOME TAX BILL 2025
WITH COMMENTARY

Other Useful Books for your Library
INCOME TAX BILL,
2025
WITH COMMENTARY

Incorporating:

+ Comparative Table Showing Income Tax Act, 1961
and Provisions of New Income Tax Bill, 2025)

+ Statement Of Objects & Reasons

+ Notes on Clauses

« Financial Memorandum

+ Income Tax Bill, 2025

+ "Tabular Clause- wise Contents of the New Income
Tax Bill*

+ Commentary on the New Income Tax Bill

+ FAQg on New Income Tax Bill

B.C. PUBLICATIONS

9"789305 " 613620

T1495

Giridhar Dhelia
Advocate:FCAACS B.COMH)

| B.C. PUBLICATIONS

AAVINANINOD HLIM ST0T “TTId XV.L AINODNI

CONTENTS

Comparative Table Showing Income Tax Act, 1961 and Provisions of New Income Tax Bill, 2025
Statement Of Objects & Reasons

Notes on Clauses

Financial Memorandum

Income Tax Bill, 2025

"Tabular Clause- wise Contents of the New Income Tax Bill”

Commentary on the New Income Tax Bill

FAQs on New Income Tax Bill

ONoOWRWNE

Author:

Vivek Jalan

[FCA, LL.M (Constitutional Law), LL.B, MBA(International Trade), B.Com(H)]
Giridhar Dhelia

Advocate, FCA, ACS, B.COM(H)

Published by: In Association With:

BOOK CORPORATION TAX CONNECT ACADEMY

4, R. N. Mukherjee Road 6, Netaji Subhas Road,

Kolkata 700001 Kolkata 700001

Phones: (033) 64547999 Cell: 7003384915

Cell: 9830010297,9331018333 Order by email:info@taxconnect.co.in
Order by email:bookcorporation@gmail.com Website : www.taxconnect.co.in
Website : www.bookcorporation.com

Tax Connect: 531st Issue
16th November 2025- 22nd November 2025



mailto:info@taxconnect.co.in
mailto:bookcorporation@gmail.com
http://www.taxconnect.co.in/
http://www.bookcorporation.com/

CONNECT] BCCc&L

AIDING BUSINESS
EXCELLENCE IN LEGAL DELIVERABLES SINCE 1833

:IN STANDS

UNION BUDGET - 2025 EDITION

Other Useful Books for your Library

LAOANY NOINN

o
~
>,
NS
Jt
=
=
-
7

CONTENTS

Commentary on Budget

Budget at a glance

Finance Minister’'s Budget Speech
Finance Bill

Memorandum

Notes on Clauses

Author:

Vivek Jalan

[FCA, LL.M (Constitutional Law), LL.B, MBA(International Trade), B.Com(H)]

Published by: In Association With:

BOOK CORPORATION TAX CONNECT ACADEMY

4, R. N. Mukherjee Road 6, Netaji Subhas Road,

Kolkata 700001 Kolkata 700001

Phones: (033) 64547999 Cell: 7003384915

Cell: 9830010297, 9331018333 Order by email: info@taxconnect.co.in
Order by email:bookcorporation@gmail.com Website : www.taxconnect.co.in

Website : www.bookcorporation.com

Tax Connect: 531st Issue
16th November 2025- 22nd November 2025



mailto:info@taxconnect.co.in
mailto:bookcorporation@gmail.com
http://www.taxconnect.co.in/
http://www.bookcorporation.com/

CONNECT] BCcc&L

AIDING BUSINESS
EXCELLENCE IN LEGAL DELIVERABLES SINCE 1833

:IN STANDS

Income Tax Section-Wise Commentary and Analysis of Recent Developments

INCOME TAX

SECTION-WISE COMMENTARY

Z
)
)
<
m
_‘
>
X

Digest containing:

| 1. 1n Part A - Ready Reference and exhaustive Charts on Income Chargeable to PGBP

| & Deductions thereon; Updated Depreciation Rates: Clause wise Analysis of Form
SCD; Clause wise chart on Transactions which are not regarded as transfer ' 47;

deductions under B0's Section, Defermination of fax i certain special cases under
TA> CONNECT” . Chart on TS; Che gy

|
2.In Part B - Digest on Analysis of various recent developments.
e o s sonasns]
LI 5, In Part C - Digest on Section-wise Case Laws

I,
< -

W - HO0K

Set of three volumes B. C. PUBLICATIONS B. C. PUBLICATIONS

CONTENTS

1. In Part A - Ready Reference and exhaustive Charts on Income Chargeable to PGBP & Deductions thereon; Updated
Depreciation Rates; Clause wise Analysis of Form 3CD; Clause wise chart on Transactions which are not regarded as transfer
u/s 47; One Glance Summary of various exemptions available in respect of Capital Gains, deductions under 80’s sections,
Determination of tax in certain special cases under commentary to section 115AC; Chart on TDS; Chart on penalties and
prosecutions, etc.

2. In Part B — Digest on Analysis of various recent developments

3. In Part C - Digest on Section-wise Case Laws

Authors:

Vivek Jalan
[FCA, LL.M (Constitutional Law), LL. B, B. Com(H)]

Published by: In Association With:

BOOK CORPORATION TAX CONNECT ACADEMY

4, R. N. Mukherjee Road 6, Netaji Subhas Road,

Kolkata 700001 Kolkata 700001

Phones: (033) 64547999 Cell: 7003384915

Cell: 9830010297, 9331018333 Order by email: info@taxconnect.co.in
Order by email:bookcorporation@gmail.com Website : www.taxconnect.co.in

Tax Connect: 531st [ssue Page19

16th November 2025- 22nd November 2025


mailto:info@taxconnect.co.in
mailto:bookcorporation@gmail.com
http://www.taxconnect.co.in/

CONNECT] BCCc&L

EXCELLENCE IN LEGAL DELIVERABLES SINCE 1833

:IN STANDS

UNION BUDGET - 2024 EDITION

Other Useful Books for your Library

B — vomrarr — LIDANE NOINN

B. C. PUBLICATION

CONTENTS

Commentary on Budget

Budget at a glance

Finance Minister’s Budget Speech
Finance Bill

Memorandum

Notes on Clauses

Author:

Vivek Jalan
[FCA, LL.M (Constitutional Law), LL.B, MBA(International Trade), B.Com(H)]

Published by: In Association With:

BOOK CORPORATION TAX CONNECT ACADEMY

4, R. N. Mukherjee Road 6, Netaji Subhas Road,

Kolkata 700001 Kolkata 700001

Phones: (033) 64547999 Cell: 7003384915

Cell: 9830010297, 9331018333 Order by email: info@taxconnect.co.in
Order by email:bookcorporation@gmail.com Website : www.taxconnect.co.in

Website www.bookcorporation.com

Tax Connect: 531st Issue
16th November 2025- 22nd November 2025



mailto:info@taxconnect.co.in
mailto:bookcorporation@gmail.com
http://www.taxconnect.co.in/
http://www.bookcorporation.com/

CONNECT] Bcc&L

Y CE NCE > - 73 - AIDING BUSINESS
EXCELLENCE IN LEGAL DELIVERABLES e R

:IN STANDS

GST APPELLATE TRIBUNAL (GSTAT)

-
S5,

GST Appellate Tribunal
(GSTAT) g "
Cooe s e i GST Appellate Tribunal

S (GSTAT)

Scrutiny, Audi
Coverage on Sections, Rules, Forms and Caselaws Relating to
dit, Rulings and Appeals

‘India ‘Bestseller
GST Pleading and Practice

(1v159)
|eunquy dejjaddy 159

g
8

Upcoming
Section Wise Compendium On GST in 2 Volumes

BpUB4'N'S
uefer Jaain

y
Vivek Jalan and Pradip Kumar Das

B. C. PUBLICATIONS
Kolkata

CONTENTS

1. A detailed Synopsis of GSTAT Appeals, Practice, Policy and Procedures
Master Summary of Act, Rules and Forms with brief understanding

Section-wise Commentary with Related provisions, Rules and Forms

P WN

Expectations From The Goods And Services Tax Appellate Tribunal (Procedure) Rules, 202x

Author:
Vivek Jalan

[FCA, LL.M (Constitutional Law), LL.B, MBA(International Trade), B.Com(H)]

S.K. Panda
[IRS-Retd.; Ex-Member CBIC & Special Secretary — GoI]

Published by: In Association With:

BOOK CORPORATION TAX CONNECT ACADEMY

4, R. N. Mukherjee Road 6, Netaji Subhas Road,

Kolkata 700001 Kolkata 700001

Phones: (033) 64547999 Cell: 7003384915

Cell: 9830010297, 9331018333 Order by email: info@taxconnect.co.in
Order by email:bookcorporation@gmail.com Website : www.taxconnect.co.in

Website :www.bookcorporation.com

Tax Connect: 531st [ssue Page21
16th November 2025- 221d November 2025


mailto:info@taxconnect.co.in
mailto:bookcorporation@gmail.com
http://www.taxconnect.co.in/
http://www.bookcorporation.com/

CONNECT] Bcc&L

- - ——ry—— - - e =y AIDING BUSINESS
EXCELLENCE IN LEGAL DELIVERABLES Pl

:IN STANDS

GST PLEADING AND PRACTICE: With Section-wise GST Cases & GST Notices and their Replies

[=ceE
o =

R o o e—

GST
Plead

GST
Pleading

and
Praclice

v Bectierwiee GHY Cases & . \res aptios

and
Praclaice

VoLuME VoLusme 3
Vivek Jatan Vivek Jalan
TPCA, LLN cComsamnnimmnanl Lavsih £85I Cuowm (1IN LALLM (Comanitvit il Lonw d LE T I8 Cowm (1N
Fradip Kumar Das Pradip Kumar Das
EALA L 10, Adloonsibe Sasperewe Cimar d IMALL N Adtciwane Swgweme Ouward
A It Oume o 1r. A {Sand ) CENTATY A Pt Comee ta, 1. Mows (Il ) CRRTAT]
ST E 0‘13‘
B. C. PUBLICATIONS (IAS<CONNUCT] bemmeeed 8. C. PUBLICATIONS FATSCONNECT]

ABOUT THE BOOK: This publication includes:

1. Recent GST Notices and their Replies
o Recent Orders and Appeals under GST
o Text of provisions under IGST Act 2017 & CGST Act 2017 updated as per Finance Act, 2023

2. CGST & IGST Section-Wise Rules, Forms, Case Laws And Notification/Circulars GIST
® CGST & IGST Section-wise Synopsis of "Question of Law” answered under GST

3. Completely Updated Synopsis Of Case Laws under GST by Supreme Court, High Court, AAARS & AARS

Authors:
Vivek Jalan

[FCA, LL.M (Constitutional Law), LL. B, B. Com(H)]

Pradip Kumar Das
[M.A. LL. B; Advocate Supreme Court & High Courts; Fr. Mem (Jud.) CESTAT]

Published by: In Association With:

BOOK CORPORATION TAX CONNECT ACADEMY

4, R. N. Mukherjee Road 6, Netaji Subhas Road,

Kolkata 700001 Kolkata 700001

Phones: (033) 64547999 Cell: 7003384915

Cell: 9830010297, 9331018333 Order by email: info@taxconnect.co.in
Order by email:bookcorporation@gmail.com Website : www.taxconnect.co.in

Website :www.bookcorporation.com

Tax Connect: 531st [ssue Page22
16th November 2025- 221d November 2025


mailto:info@taxconnect.co.in
mailto:bookcorporation@gmail.com
http://www.taxconnect.co.in/
http://www.bookcorporation.com/

CONNECT]

EXCELLENCE IN LEGAL DELIVERABLES

BCcc&L

AIDING BUSINESS
SINCE 1833

:IN STANDS

HANDBOOK ON GST 2022

[ Handl e
GST
2022

Handbdok on

GST
2022

Coverage on CGST Law, IGST Law, UTGST Law,
Compensation to States Act, Settlement of Funds Rules.
Act, 2022)

August 2022

India Bestseller
GST Pleading and Practice

2P
2
-
e ¢
=1

a0
%

epued ‘) 'S
UBEr OAIA

Salient Features of the Book :
1 n-d

TAXCONNECT

B. C. PUBLICATIONS

Kolkata TA><CONNEC

CONTENTS

5. 47%™ GST Council in-depth Analysis of Amendment

6. Linkage of Section, Rules, Notifications, Circulars, Orders

N

Master Reference of Section, Rules, Notifications, Circulars, Orders
Bare Acts & Rules
GST Forms

© ®

Author:
Vivek Jalan

[FCA, LL.M (Constitutional Law), LL.B, B.Com(H)]

S.K. Panda
[IRS-Retd.; Ex-Member CBIC & Special Secretary — GoI]

Published by:

BOOK CORPORATION

4, R. N. Mukherjee Road

Kolkata 700001

Phones: (033) 64547999

Cell: 9830010297, 9331018333

Order by email:bookcorporation@gmail.com

Website :www.bookcorporation.com

In Association With:

TAX CONNECT ACADEMY

, Netaji Subhas Road,

Kolkata 700001

Cell: 7003384915

Order by email: info@taxconnect.co.in

@)

Website : www.taxconnect.co.in

Tax Connect: 531st Issue

16th November 2025- 221d November 2025

Page23


mailto:info@taxconnect.co.in
mailto:bookcorporation@gmail.com
http://www.taxconnect.co.in/
http://www.bookcorporation.com/

CONNECT} BCcc&L

- 7 AIDING BUSINESS
EXCELLENCE IN LEGAL DELIVERABLES e R

:IN STANDS

TAX PLEADING AND PRACTICE JOURNAL

GST Pleading and Pruciicn i , B lax I’I(’a(“l\‘(\i
e N and Practice

Emm Journal

GRS & 5T Sactes e Sy of

SET OF 2 VOLUMES
Priev.
‘ LT l
Vivek Julan
1P L2 ot stboml Lo L2 10 5 (011
Pradip Kusmar Das

(B4 L2 Adbwacise oy
£ 22 Cares: P Mo ¢l ) CEXTAT)

CONTENTS

7. Recent Notices and replies on GST & Income Tax

8. Impact Analysis on GST, Customs and DGFT Developments: In September 2023

9. Impact Analysis on Direct Taxes, International Tax, PMLA Developments: In September 2023
10. Articles

Author:

Vivek Jalan
[FCA, LL.M (Constitutional Law), LL.B, B.Com(H)]

S.K. Panda
[IRS-Retd.; Ex-Member CBIC & Special Secretary — GoI]

P.K. Das
[IRS-Retd.; Ex-Member CBDT & Special Secretary — GoI]

Published by: In Association With:

BOOK CORPORATION TAX CONNECT ACADEMY

4, R. N. Mukherjee Road 6, Netaji Subhas Road,

Kolkata 700001 Kolkata 700001

Phones: (033) 64547999 Cell: 7003384915

Cell: 9830010297, 9331018333 Order by email: info@taxconnect.co.in
Order by email:bookcorporation@gmail.com Website : www.taxconnect.co.in

Website :www.bookcorporation.com

Tax Connect: 531st Issue
16th November 2025- 221d November 2025



mailto:info@taxconnect.co.in
mailto:bookcorporation@gmail.com
http://www.taxconnect.co.in/
http://www.bookcorporation.com/

CONNECT] Bcc&L

EXCELLENCE IN LEGAL DELIVERABLES A'Dé?'rfciﬁ';SESS
:IN STANDS
How to Handle GST LITIGATION: Assessment, Scrutiny, Audit & Appeal
How to Handle
GST
How to Handle
. Al @
=3 GST
SOPS, =i og® e
=% @3 Litigation
India Bestseller 5 e ] )
GST Pleading and Practice = E % Assessment, Scrutiny, Audit & Appeal
g - Coverage on Sections, Rules, Forms and Caselaws relating to
FCA LLM rm‘{i:::f\(;\‘laalinL LB, B.Com{H)
@ Bikramijit Ghosh
5‘ = FCA, B.Com (H)
o | =3
€ , é g Sali;zn_l Features of the Book :
B.C.PUBLICATIONS  [TA>XCONNECT]
CONTENTS
1. 50 Most Burning issues in GST-Litigation
2. Reference of Section, Rules, Notifications, Circulars, Orders relating to GST Assessment, Scrutiny, Audit & Appeal
3. Case Laws relating to GST Litigation handling
4. GST Forms relating to Litigation handling
5. New process to file returns in GSTR 3B as per circular 170 explained in details u/s 59
6. Discussion on SOP on Scrutiny of Returns and GST Audit Manual by CBIC under respective Sections
7. Discussion on Recent Instruction on GST-Summons, Arrest and Bail
Authors:
Vivek Jalan
[FCA, LL.M (Constitutional Law), LL. B, B. Com(H)]
Bikramjit Ghosh
[FCA, B. Com(H)]
Published by: In Association With:
BOOK CORPORATION TAX CONNECT ACADEMY
4, R. N. Mukherjee Road 6, Netaji Subhas Road,
Kolkata 700001 Kolkata 700001
Phones: (033) 64547999 Cell: 7003384915
Cell: 9830010297, 9331018333 Order by email: info@taxconnect.co.in
Order by email:bookcorporation@gmail.com Website : www.taxconnect.co.in
|
Tax Connect: 531st Issue Page25

16th November 2025- 22nd November 2025


mailto:info@taxconnect.co.in
mailto:bookcorporation@gmail.com
http://www.taxconnect.co.in/

CONNECT]

EXCELLENCE IN LEGAL DELIVERABLES

BCcc&L

AIDING BUSINESS
SINCE 1833

LET'S DISCUSS FURTHER!

OUR OFFICES:
@ MUMBAI ) @ BENGALURU )
)
Unit No. 312, Omega 951, 24" Main Road, J P
Business Park, Near Nagar, Bengaluru,

Thane West,
Mabharashtra- 400604

Jha

€

nect.co.in

Kaamgar Hospital, Road No.
33, Wagle Industrial Estate,

Contact Person: Prashant

Email:prashant.jha@taxcon

Karnataka — 560078.

Contact Person: Anil Pal

Email:anil.pal@taxconnect
delhi.co.in

&

J

@ DELHI (NCR)

B-139, 2nd Floor, Transport
Nagar,
Noida-201301 (U.P)

Contact Person: Poonam

Khemka

Email:poonam.khemka@taxc

C

onnect.co.in D

Kolkata - 700001

Mandal

Email:sandeep.mandal@

()3 taxconnect.co.in

Contact Person: Sandeep

@ KOLKATA ) @ KOLKATA

6, Netaji Subhas Road, 3™ R No 119; 1st Floor;
Floor, Royal Exchange Diamond Arcade; 1/72,
Building, Cal Jessore Road,

Kolkata — 700055
Contact Person: Uttam
Kumar Singh

Email:uttam.singh@taxco

(); nnect.co.in

Disclaimer:
This e-bulletin is for private circulation only. Views expressed herein are of the editorial team and are based on the
information, explanation and documents available on Government portal platforms. Tax Connect or any of its employees
do not accept any liability whatsoever direct or indirect that may arise from the use of the information contained herein.
No matter contained herein may be reproduced without prior consent of Tax Connect. While this e-article has been
prepared on the basis of published/other publicly available information considered reliable, we do not accept any liability
for the accuracy of its contents.
Tax Connect 2025. All rights reserved.
Tax Connect: 531st [ssue Page26

16th November 2025- 22nd November 2025

@ DUBAI

Azizi Feirouz, 803, 8th Floor,
AL Furjan, Opposite Discovery
Pavillion,

Dubai, UAE

Contact Person: Rohit Sharma

Email:rohit.sharma@taxconne
ct.co.in

&




